
Easfern Sfar To Meet Tonight
A memorial service and Ini­ 

tiation are on the agenda for 
tonight's meeting of Torrance 
Chapter No. 380, Order of the. 
Eastern Star. The meeting will 
be held In the Masonic Temple, 
2336 Canrillo ave., and will start 

p.m. Dorothy Fylken, wor- 
matron, and Edward Mor­

gan, worthy patron, will pre 
side.

Letha Wells Is chairman for] 
the social hour which follows 
the meeting, and all members 
of the Chapter and visiting 
members of the Order are ex 
trndprl a cordial invitation to 
attend.
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NORRIS TO
ADDRESS
AQUARISTS

Ken Norrls of Marineland of 
he Pacific will be the guest 

speaker for the June meeting: of 
he Harbor Aquarium society, 
o be held on Tuesday, June 26, 
it 7:30 p.m. in the auditorium 
it the Gardena Community 
"enter. 1651 Market, street in 
iardona.

The meeting wiJl be called to 
order by President Charles 
Jones.

The topic will be/'California

Marine Fish Suitable for the 
Aquarium."

Norris will present slides to 
Illustrate his lecture on Cali­ 
fornia fish.

The show fish chosen for the 
monthly show, will be the Wag­ 
tails, which includes several 
color types of platies as well 
a,s the swordtail.

The door prize will be a five- 
gallon tank and hood.

Refreshments will be served 
after the meeting. Any and all 
persons Interested in tropical 

fish are Invited to attend.

Classified Ads ring the bell 
every day by registering cash, 
sales for people who buy, sell, 
rent or iease. Phone your want 
ad to FA. 8-2345 for fast results.
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Cub Scouts 
Win Awards

When Cub Scout Pack 953C 
recently met at the Crenshaw 
school, opening ceremonies were 
conducted hy Den 6. An amus­ 
ing cowboy skit was presented 
by Rod Balllie, Len Damerow, 
Bill Russell. Larry Aniocochea, 
Art Ewart and Steve Price, of 
Don 2.

Awards wore presented for 
Scout-o»Scopp ticket sales as 
follows: tie slides to Len Dame- 
row, Steve Price, Bill Russell, 
Alfred Wierenga, Chris Pre- 
seott and Wayne Nelson. Alfred 
Wierenga was given the placard.

The following boys also re­ 
ceived awards:

Bob Cats: Larry Andicochea, 
Den 2; Robert Andrew, Den 3; 
Joe McDowell. Den 4; David 
Stewart and Bill Ament, Den 8. 
Den 1: Jerry Carrire, Bear 
Badge. Den 2: Steve 'Price, 
Bear Badge and Gold Arrow; 
Art Ewart, Silver Arrow; Rod 
Baillie, Silver Arrow. Den 3: 
Alfred Wierenga, Denner; Ken­ 
neth Ferris, Assistant; Denner. 
Den 4: Douglas Jackson, two 
Silver Arrows; Richard Butter- 
field, B^ar Badge; Marvin Wat- 
kins, Lion Badge; Joe Mc­ 
Dowell. Denner. Den 6: John 
Robison, Wolf Badge; Thomas 
Hanson, Wolf Badge; Mike Me- 
Abee, Wolf Badge. Den 7: Mark 
Hansen, Bear Badge; Alan Gay- 
rift. Wolf Badge. Gold Arrow. 
Denner; George Fulton, Gold 
Arrow and Assistant Denner.

Webelos: Jerry Blake, Silver
Arrow on Lion Badge. Den
Chiefs: Bill Capps and Jim Hill.

The July Pack meeting will
be a beach party.

CLASSIFIED ADS present a 
parade of values every dav in 
the year. Anything can be sold 
through Want Ads. Dial FA. S- 
234f> and parade your poods 
before the TORRANCE PRESS 
audience.
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Nancy Maxwell Installed 
Queen of Job's Daughters

"T.he Waltz of the Butterflies" \vas the theme chosen for the June installation 
rite, when officers for Lomita Bethel No. 137, International Order of Job's Daugh­ 
ters, were inducted, with Nancy Maxwell as Honored Queen.

Over three hundred re'-'tives and friends filled the Lomita Masonic Temple for 
the ceremonies held last Satur­ 
day evening.

A large butterfly of glitter­ 
ing gold, yellow, blue and red, 
with the wings opening and 
closing ns though it was flut­ 
tering, served as the entry for 
the officers and choir.

Charles W. Veeck, Associate 
Guardian of Bethel No. 24, and 
close friend of the ' honored 
queen's family for many years, 
was master of ceremonies. Pre­ 
ceding the officers Mrs. Pe.i 
Washburn. Bethel guardian; A. 
vin Crawford, associate guar­ 
dian; and Shirley Washburn, re­ 
tiring honored queen were es­ 
corted to the East.

Installing officers were Dal* 
lene Beauchamp. guide; Janeth 
Horton. marshal!; Margaret 
Jean Shields, recorder; Ittary 
Faughnder, Chaplain; Marl 
Lynn Durmington. Sr. custo­ 
dian; Verne Jean McDanlels, Jr. 
custodian, all past honored 
queens of Bethel No. 57; Martini 
Kiley, Bible Bearer; Sharoti 
Hartman, Flag Bearer; and 
Maurette Schorr, electrician.

Nancy Maxwell, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles A. Bren- 
neman. 1702 W. 244th St., Lo­ 
mita, carrying a glittering mon­ 
arch butterfly with red roses 
and white camel las was in­ 
ducted honored queen to suc­ 
ceed Shirley Washburn. Other 
line officers carried smaller hut- 
trflies with vivid colored- flow­ 
ers and, glitter. In their order 
they appeared through the
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• Honored Queen Installed
The glittering and colorful wings' of the butterfly served as « \ 
background for the lovely installation ceremonies held by Job'i 
Daughters last Saturday night. Gowned in the traditional rebel, 
Nancy Maxwell was installed Honored Queen for the coming 
year.
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wings of the butterfly as fol­ 
lows: Carmen Gonzales, Sr. 
prlneess, Gloria Grubbs, Jr. 
princess; Joyce Loedige, guide; 
Lalla Willson, marshall.

Appointive officers were 
Cathy Schweitzer. Sr. custo­ 
dian; Christy Schweitzer. Jr. 
custodian; Janlce Mayer, inner 
jjuard; Janlce Loedige, outer 
Ktiarrl; .Tacqulyn Barnett, re­ 
corder; Judy Lowe. treasurer; 
Shnri Church, librarian; Sue 
Chapman, musician; Sharon 
Monroe, Marcia, Chamberlain, 
Karen Eggers, Diana Gillgren, 
and Linda De Walsche, first, 
second, third fourth, and fifth 
messengers in order; Frances 
Mackay chaplain; Julia Som- 
ers, electrician; Sharon Bench, 
page; Sa'ndra Gregory. Mary 
Lee Chudy. Nancy Coil and 
Dlane Kennedy, as assistants to 
recorder, musician, outer guard 
and flag bearer In order named. 
Cathie Smith, choir director 
and the Bethel choir.

'The Walt/ of the Butter­ 
flies", an original composition 
by H. Burlinghame, was sung 
by Lee Hughes, accompanied 
by .Tanice Hargett. as the hon­ 
ored queen entered through the 
butterfly to be escorted to the 
East by Arthur Nowell. asso­ 
ciate guadian of Bethel No. 57. 
The beautiful "Lord's Prayer" 
was sunar following the escort 
of the Holy Bible into the 
Bethel. A very lovely touch was 
the surprise planned by Nancy 
Maxwell, honored queen for her 
mother, when she had the musi­ 
cian and soloist play "My Mom" 
and then escorted her mother to 
the Altar as It was sung.

Hostesses were Joan Birch- 
ler. Dorothy Griggs. Audrian 
ttozendal. and Sharon Thomas; 
Doylene Williams Fan pel took 
charge of the guest book and 
the ushers were Ron and Don 
Wallace.

Mr. Leonard Babcook. As­ 
sociate Guardian Bethel No. 50. 
gave the Benediction.

The Mothers' Club, under the 
direction of president-elect, Vir- 

j ginia Basile. was in charge of 
refreshments served In the din­ 
ing room. The cakes were deco­ 
rated in gay colorful flowers 
with butterflies scattered over

them, and rainbow punch and 
coffee were served. 

A large group remained tor
the dance which followed th* 
ceremonies and was enjoyed by 
all.

Litflefield 
To Address 
Garden Club

The Beau Jardin Garden club 
will hear a talk by Joe Little- 
field, one of the Southland'* 
foremost garden authorities, 
during its Wednesday, June 27 
r.-,eeting at Seaside Community 
church. 230th and Ocean blvd., 
at 8:30, p.m.

Ltttlefield, famous for his 
practical, down to earth garden­ 
ing advice, will discuss "Timely 
Gardening Information." ^

In both his lectures, and tfie 
articles he contributes to lead­ 
ing garden magazines, Joe 
Littlefield reveals a lively and 
fiithusiastic personality. He ils 
widely known for his sincere 
interest in the problems of 
home gardeners, as well as for 
the refreshing informality of 
his talks.

A "dirt-under-the-fingernalls" 
g&rttener for over twenty-ffve 
years, his approach to garden­ 
ing is practical and down-to- 
earth. "You don't have to, be 
born with a green thumb," he 
maintains. "Learn the compara­ 
tively few fundamentals of good 

j gardening, follow through on 
them conscientiously," and 
you're almost bound to get 
green thumb results."
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