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For the creative businessman 

vho can come up with SUM 
thinps as a three-cent me^l. a 
$1 stove or a $150 automobile, 
there is a mass market of near­ 
ly two billion people waiting.

This market spans the entire 
wr-ld. finding itself in some 30 
new and underdeveloped na- 
tiins Despite the vast sums of 
foreign aid the government 
pours into these countries, the 
spendable income in these re-

| gions has remained so low that 
1 there'd be almost no demand 
I for items like the above except 
| at those fairy-tale prices

So American science, tech­ 
nology and that old reliable 
American "know-how" are 
faced with what may be the 
greatest challenge ever to con­ 
front the world of inutistry

Already hard at work on the 
problem are better than a score 
of American industrial con­ 
cerns. Included in the buiging

barrel of low-cost products in 
demand are: tinv tractors- pre­ 
fab houses, stores and facto 
ries; solar water heaters; con­ 
tact lenses.

The people of the impover­ 
ished nations are still waiting 
for the inventive businessmen 
who can "get there first with 
the cheapest."

BEAU GESTE The roster of 
relief organizations rushing to 
the aid of the survivors of the

recent Alaska earthquake roads 
like a "Who's Who in the World 
of dood Heeds"   and it in­ 
cludes one type of enterprise 
not customarily thouehl of as 
a relief agency.

In a move designed to "raise 
the spirits." so to speak, of -he 
disaster-struck populace. Schen- 
ley Industries. Inc. came forth 
and announced that it would 
replace without charge all of 
the Schenley liquor destroyed 
in the great quake.

This same company has in 
similar fashion come to the re­ 
lief of survivors of such disas­ 
ters as the Hilo, Hawaii, tidal 
waves and the floods in Marys- 
ville-Yuba City. California, and 
in Connecticut

There's still a tremendous lot 
of hard, grinding work to do in 
restoring buildings and trade 
in the stricken areas of Alaska, 
but if there is some comfort in 
having a friendly glass to top 
off a hard day. there must be

extra satisfaction for the store 
man who is enabled, by the 
Schenley action, to make it 
available.

GRADUATION GIFTS — It
used to be that a high schooler 
had to wait for graduation for 
his or her first watch, unless 
he had inherited a family heir­ 
loom. But market researchers 
for Bulova Watch Co. estima­ 
ted that fully half the members 
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The researchers figure about 
2.2 million youngsters will re­ 
ceive their high school diplo­ 
mas in .June and about one in 
seven will also get a new time­ 
piece to mark the occasion

Two causes are given for the 
sharp increase in watch own­ 
ership among teen-agers. Not 
only do more youngsters re­ 
quire a watch earlier because 
of their busy, modern-day 
sd' .chile, say the researchers, 
hut improved technology has 
enabled manufacturers to pro­ 
duce quality timepieces that 
sell at economy prices. Bulovr. 
itself introduced a whole new 
group of "Caravelle" jeweled- 
lever timepieces two years ago 
at prices ranging from Slfl.95 
to $29.95. and consumer re­ 
sponse has been so favorable 
that the company this year is 
offering no fewer than 70 dif­ 
ferent Caravelle styles for men 
and women.

THINGS TO COME   Solo 
Sauna: A one-person sauna bath 
that runs on ordinary house­ 
hold electric current is avail­ 
able to heat-bath lovers. This 
hefty little heater, weighing a 
mere 225 pounds, has a mahog­ 
any exterior and a one-piece 
fiberglas interior ... A new- 
battery that can show at a 
glance whether it is in ton con­ 
dition or unserviceable is 
equipped with a litmus indicat­ 
or that changes color according 
to battery condition . . .

For those tight spots the do- 
it-yourselfer will welcome the 
new finger-tip wrench that fits 
over the finger like a ring and 
has a special device that holds 
the nut securely while working. 
Available in variety of sizes.

     
AFTER THE FAIR   When 

the stakes are finally pulled, 
bringing to an end the World's 
Fair in New York, sightseers, 
shoppers and market-minded 
businessmen will be turning 
their attention to another mon­ 
ument to international com- 
mercc,_tlle World Trade Cen­ 
ter in New York. Trade Center 
officials enthusiastically report 
that agreements have already 
been signed or are being pre­ 
pared with more than 100 com­ 
panies in the field of interna­ 
tional trade and service. This 
involves approximately 500,000 
square feet of the four million 
available at the soon-to-be-built 
center.

• • •
BITS O' BUSINESS   Look 

for the Gross National Product 
to be around $620 billion at 
year-end as compared with last 
year's total of $585 billion . . . 
U.S. exports are continuing to 
climb helping to offset the na­ 
tion's deficit in the interna­ 
tional balance of payments. 
This year, total exports for the 
first quarter were $24.6 billion, 
up $.8 billion over 1963 first- 
quarter results . . . During the 
first three months of 1964. new 
jobs grew by 1.4 million, where­ 
as the increase in available 
workers was a mere 1.2 million.
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Service Topic 
Is "Practice'

Emma M. Muffley, minister 
of the Unity Church of Christ- 
lanity, will speak on "Practice 
Lessons" at the 10:50 a.m. ser­ 
vice Sunday, at the Walteria 
Park Building, 3855 W. 242nd 
St.

Mrs. Alexis Pestoff ii the 
youth and children's director.

McNally Appointed 
To General Manager 
Of Local Insurance Co.
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